
 

 

 

Network Services Company Chosen as 2015 Innovation Partner of the Year by Sodexo 

FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

Schaumburg, IL – June 22, 2015 – Network Services Company (NETWORK®), a significant force in national 

janitorial distribution, is pleased to announce the company has been designated Sodexo’s 2015 Innovation Vendor 
Partner of the Year, Facilities Management.  Sodexo is a global leader in services that improve Quality of Life.  The 
company provides clients an integrated offer from foodservices, reception, maintenance and cleaning, to facilities and 
equipment management. 

NETWORK was recognized for innovation, collaboration, responsiveness and overall impact on the Quality of Life by 
creating ease and efficiencies for Sodexo’s operators.  Sodexo leadership celebrated NETWORK’s expertise in 
designing and executing a national program with centralized spend management controls and enhanced service 
levels.  Frank Barretta, NETWORK’s Vice President of Business Development pointed out, “The NETWORK - 
Sodexo relationship spans almost two decades.  We’re honored to have our organization’s commitment to the core 
principles of flexibility, accountability, and expertise acknowledged by such an influential leader in the industry.  We 
look forward to delivering exceptional service to Sodexo operators for years to come.”    

For additional information on NETWORK’s capabilities to impact supply chain efficiencies and drive success for your 
business, visit www.networkdistribution.com. 

About Network Services Company 

NETWORK is the flexible distribution solution that improves supply chain efficiency and drives business success. For 
corporate accounts in healthcare, industrial, commercial real estate, foodservice, printing and the public sector, 
NETWORK offers deep experience, vast infrastructure, customizable programs and best-in-class products in our 
core categories janitorial supplies and equipment, foodservice disposables, of packaging supplies and equipment, 
and printing papers. Our system blends single-source convenience with true local market presence on an 
international scale. Centralized account management provides greater control, while our network of distributors 
delivers the flexibility, accountability and category expertise you need to stay ahead of the competition. You'll call this 
a better way to do business. We call it Distribution by Design®.  
 
For more information, visit www.networkdistribution.com or call 800.683.0334.  

 
About Sodexo  

Founded in 1966 in Marseille by Pierre Bellon, Sodexo is the global leader in services that improve Quality of Life, an 
essential factor in individual and organizational performance. Operating in 80 countries, Sodexo serves 75 million 
consumers each day through its unique combination of On-site Services, Benefits and Rewards Services and 
Personal and Home Services.  
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